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Dear Editor-in-Chief 
 
One of the controversial topics in cancer research 
and its clinical approach is the influence of biopsy 
on the possibility of tumor spread and metastasis 
that seems to be a new issue in medical knowledge 
(1-2), but Avicenna in more than a thousand years 
ago (980–1037 AD) in his book (Cannon of medi-
cine) has been connoting on this subject (3).  
According to the Avicenna opinion, cancer is de-

scribed as a "solid swelling" (tumor) which is 
firmly attached to the adjacent organ (4). In this 
point of view, being susceptible to cancer depends 
on quality of life such as nutrition, physical activ-
ity etc. (3, 4). The other risk factor on which Avi-
cenna emphasized is past history of injury and 
trauma, damage and chronic or severe pain in 
different parts of the body. He believed that pain 
and trauma absorbs substances including natural 
and toxic materials from the other parts of body 
to the pain point that can start genesis of cancer. 
Traumas moreover can damage self-layer of swell-
ing in cancerous tissue, and disperse disease lo-
cally or generally in body (3, 4).  
Nowadays multiple continuing traumas in the 
same region of the body (skin or oral mucosa) is a 
known cause of cancer (5). Chronic inflammation 
is a precursor factor of tumor progression and 
many cancers have been found to occur from 
location of infection, chronic irritation, and 

inflammation (6, 7). Trauma induces tumor 
immunosuppressive factors that increase vascular 
permeability and facilitating passage of the tumor 
cells into the other tissues (8).  
Moreover, some studies even showed the relation-
ship between single trauma and cancer develop-
ment. It can also lead to a significant increase in 
tumor size over a short duration times (8). Indeed 
traumatizing the cancer tissue leads to trigger in-
flammation process that allows cells to progress 
by proliferation, survival, and migration (9).  
Based on this theory, Avicenna and his followers 
forbade physicians from manipulation without 
complete removal of tumors. They stated: 
“tranquilize the tumor, do not stimulate it”, so 
they used medicinal herbs like Viola Odorata L. 
(banafshe), Nymphea Alba L. (niloofar) and Cucurbita 
pepo to calm tumors cells. Some new studies have 
been shown effects of such herbs on inhibition of 
cancer cell growth (3, 4). Therefore, it seems that 
the use of the herbs before biopsy will reduce the 
chances of potential tumor spreading (10). 
According to Avicenna’s recommendation in 
more than thousand years ago, we propose the use 
of non-invasive methods such as laboratory 
parameters and biomarkers, for tumor detection; 
although the effect of biopsy in cancer metastases 
is not conclusive. We also suggest further 
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investigation on also the influence of herbal drugs 
such as syrup of violets for tumor cells tranquiliz-
ing before the biopsy 
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